



AWARD to WATERWORKS for  
PLASTIC HDPE PIPE

**ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT**

Administrator's Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640

Road and Bridge Department: 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

**Clay Copeland**

Highway Superintendent

(573) 315-6996

ccopeland@sfcgov.org

**John Gross**

Highway Administrator

(573) 631-0603

igross@sfcgov.org

**Office**

PH (573) 431-4794

FAX (573) 747-3014

roadandbridge@sfcgov.org

**BID – CULVERT PIPE**

**Bid Opening – March 9, 2021**

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name: Waterwork Specialties, Inc.  
 Address: 7801 Berry Road  
 Address \_\_\_\_\_  
 City, State, Zip: Bonne Terre, MO 63628

Contact Person  
Aaron Carrow  
 Contact Phone Number(s)  
 Office: 573.358.1826  
 Fax: 573.358.7304

GAUGE	ITEM	PRICE PER FT
16	12" C.M.P.	\$No Bid
16	15" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
16	18" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
16	24" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
16	30" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
16	36" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
16	48" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
14	36" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
14	48" C.M.P.	\$ No Bid
	12" HDPE - Soil Tight	\$5.89
	15" HDPE - ST	\$8.20
	18" HDPE - ST	\$11.25
	24" HDPE - ST	\$17.95
	30" HDPE - ST	\$26.07
	36" HDPE - ST	\$32.84
	48" HDPE - ST	\$56.22
	60" HDPE - ST	\$89.42

BOTH

	12" HDPP - ST	\$7.29
	12" HDPP - ST	\$10.29
	18" HDPP - ST	\$15.50
	24" HDPP - ST	\$23.23
	30" HDPP - ST	\$35.7
	36" HDPP - ST	\$41.56
	48" HDPP - ST	\$73.26
	60" HDPP - ST	\$101.61

**Waterwork Specialties, Inc-Bonne Terre**  
 7801 Berry Road  
 Bonne Terre, MO 63628

# QUOTATION

Quote Number: 8561  
 Quote Date: Feb 25, 2021  
 Page: 1

Voice: 573-358-1826  
 Fax: 573-358-7304

**Quoted To:**  
 St. Francois County Highway Dept.  
 1 W. Liberty Suite 301  
 Farmington, MO 63640

**JOB:**  
 JOB: 2021 BID - CULVERT PIPE

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
STFRANCOISCOHWYDEPT	3/27/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
		***NO BID ON 12"-48" C.M.P.*** *****		
		***12"-60" HDPE***		
1.00	82011012	12" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	5.89	5.89
1.00	82011015	15" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	8.20	8.20
1.00	82011018	18" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	11.25	11.25
1.00	82011024	24" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	17.95	17.95
1.00	82011030	30" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	26.07	26.07
1.00	82011036	36" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	32.84	32.84
1.00	82011042	42" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	47.42	47.42
1.00	82011048	48" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	56.22	56.22
1.00	82011049	60" ADS/Hancor HDPE N12 STIB 20'	89.42	89.42
		***12"-60" HDPP***		
1.00	82016012	12" Hancor HDPP Pipe 20' Section	7.29	7.29
1.00	82016015	15" Hancor HDPP Pipe 20' Section	10.29	10.29
1.00	82016018	18" Hancor HDPP Pipe 20' Section	15.50	15.50
1.00	82016024	24" Hancor HDPP Pipe 20' Section	23.23	23.23
1.00	82016030	30" Hancor HDPP Pipe 20' Section	35.70	35.70
1.00	82016036	36" Hancor HDPP DWALL Pipe 20' Section	41.56	41.56
1.00	82016042	42" Hancor HDPP DWALL Pipe 20' Section	54.12	54.12
1.00	82016048	48" Hancor HDPP DWALL Pipe 20' Section	73.26	73.26
1.00	82016060	60" Hancor HDPP DWALL Pipe 20' Section	101.61	101.61

\*\*\*THIS IS WATERWORK SPECIALTIES INC. INTERPRETATION OF BID FOR THE ABOVE JOB\*\*\*

\*\*\*THIS QUOTE IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS FROM DATE QUOTED UNLESS OTHERWISE SPECIFIED.\*\*\*

Subtotal	657.82
Sales Tax	
Freight	
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>657.82</b>